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Secondary school, quality education and practical skills
gains for young people in the rural area on Rusinga Island.

General Information

Funding entity Slovak Aid

Recipient Country Kenya

Implementing
Organization Humanistické centrum NAROVINU

Implementing
Organization Code

NON-GOVERNMENTAL ORGANISATIONS
(NGOs) AND CIVIL SOCIETY

Geo Location Homa Bay, KE

  Longitude 34.45714

  Latitude -0.52731

Start of
Commitment 2014-11-18

End of
Commitment 2016-10-31

Currency EUR

Status OECD approved

Description

In line with the Slovak Republic Strategy for Development Cooperation
with the Republic of Kenya for the period 2014-2018, the project
promotes sustainable and equitable socio-economic development of
the Republic of Kenya in education and agriculture. Development
problem - the isolated Rusinga Island in Lake Victoria in western
Kenya has about 22,000 inhabitants, of whom about half are children
under 15 years. As a result of HIV/AIDS, malnutrition, poor hygiene
and morbidity, the island has one of the highest mortality rates, both
in Kenya and in the world, and therefore a large numbers of orphans.
Our organization's project on the island began in 2005; we have been
slowly improving the health status of the local community by the
successful operation of the health center. Aim of the project - for the
development of this area, to enhance the quality of life of the
community, and to reduce unemployment, it is extremely important to
ensure access to quality education, including the gaining of practical
skills for all young people, including orphans, living without any care.
The project focuses on sustainable development, not a short-term
improvement. Specific objectives - the aim of the project is to build
the first part of a secondary school with a dormitory, which will be a
continuation of education in the already-built primary school and
nursery, both operating exclusively on the principle of non-violent
communication. All first graduates of the 8-year elementary school
completed their studies with tests in 12/2013 with outstanding
results, and were recommended further study. The new high school
will be part of a complex project – an existing community center in
which we gradually, since 2005, built a nursery and an 8-year primary
school, the orphanage for 72 children, a health center with 24h
services (including a bed section), 2 playgrounds and a school farm.
Currently we are completing the preparation of the construction of
the library and computer lab in the complex, which will be completed
in 2015. Thanks to our funding program that has provided our
organization successfully in Kenya since 2002, young people whose
parents cannot pay for studies and of course students without
parents, will be able to study. The high school education will focus on
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parents, will be able to study. The high school education will focus on
working with new IT technologies; practical skills and qualifications
will focus on agriculture and fish farming. Further, the project aims to
increase the economic and food self-sufficiency of the existing
community center, where up to 390 children eat daily. This we want
to ensure by promoting fish farming and by the establishment of a
stoneware workshop. Activities of the project - construction of the
first part of the secondary school with a dormitory for 60 students,
including equipment and operation for the first year, and a seminar
for teachers, focusing on the introduction of innovative methods in
teaching (IT, etc.). Other activities: introduction of innovative fish
farming on Lake Victoria in floating cages, establishment of a
stoneware workshop for stone processing soapstone and
subsequent sale of products to the Czech Republic, and a further
workshop on windmills as an alternative source of electricity
associated with the implementation. Our future high school students
will be engaged in all activities as part of building their practical skills
and professional qualifications. All project activities are in line with
environmental protection and sustainable development; in the
project, partners from Slovakia, Czech Republic, Kenya, Uganda and
Spain will work together, thereby it will promote an international
character and the sharing of experience and knowledge. Project
output - a functional first part of high school and the associated
increase in the number of young people who find employment in the
labor market more easily, the increase of number of qualified
teachers who use innovative methods in teaching, the operation of
the fishing farm with an innovat

Commitments and Amount Extended
(EUR)

Reporting Year Commitments Amount Extended

2014 281 788 € 39 644 €

2015 0 € 109 094 €

2016 0 € 133 050 €

Total 281 788 € 281 788 €

Sectors share

Sector name Share

Vocational training 100.0 %

Statistics

Statistics show the proportion of the Secondary school, quality
education and practical skills gains for young people in the rural area
on Rusinga Island. project compared to the implementing subject and
the type of flow
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